£ Mail

From HR on 2021-09-29 14:38
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Hi Alexey,

No problem, sorry it is written from
Heidelberg but refers to EMBL-EBI paying for
her removal. As far as I am aware, Milena has
chosen not to relocate her belongings at this
moment and so EMBL-EBI have not yet paid for
her removal unfortunately and all three days
should be taken as annual leave.

Kind regards,
Nabiilah

On 29/09/2021 14:33, Alexey Sokolov wrote:
Hi Nabiilah,

thanks for response. I don’t quite get what
does it mean “paid by the Laboratory”, does
it mean that this day should be paid by
ENA? I'm asking, because our new starter
Milena Mansurova spent 3 days last week on
relocation, does it mean that she can
request one day as special leave and
another two days should be requested as
standard annual leave?
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